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Behavioral Criminology is a multidisciplinary approach that draws on behavior-
al research for the application of behavioral theories and methods to assessment, 
prevention, and intervention efforts directed toward violent crime and criminal 
behavior. Disciplines relevant to this field are criminology; criminal justice (law 
enforcement and corrections); forensic, correctional, and clinical psychology and 
psychiatry: neuropsychology, neurobiology, conflict and dispute resolution; sociol-
ogy, and epidemiology. Areas of study and application include, but are not limited 
to: specific crimes and perpetrators (e.g., homicide and sex crimes, crimes against 
children, child exploitation, domestic, school, and workplace violence), topics of 
current national and international interest and concern (e.g., terrorism and counter 
terrorism, cyber crime), and strategies geared toward evaluation, identification, and 
interdiction with regard to criminal acts (e.g., hostage negotiation, criminal investi-
gative analysis, threat and risk assessment).

The aim of the proposed Briefs is to provide practitioners and researchers with 
information, data, and current best practices on important and timely topics in Be-
havioral Criminology. Each Brief will include a review of relevant research in the 
area, original data, implications of findings, case illustrations (where relevant), and 
recommendations for directions that future efforts might take.
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Abstract

School violence has been a “hot topic” among the press, politicians, academics, 
and the general population for over 15 years. During that time, there has been an 
eruption in research activity that focuses on correlates (e.g., bullying, antisocial 
behavior/psychopathy, gender, ethnicity, and parenting and family issues), 
interventions for victims and offenders (e.g., trauma-focused cognitive behavior 
therapy), and prevention (e.g., averted school shootings, school captive takings). In 
this monograph we review the research on each of these topics and offer summaries 
and recommendations for professionals who work in or with schools.


