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v

Power of Oral Culture in Education: Theorizing Proverbs, Idioms, and 
Folklore Tales is a timely and relevant response to calls for anti-racist and 
anti-colonial approaches to education. It challenges hegemonic knowl-
edge and coloniality in schooling that privilege one way of knowing and 
one truth, concepts that serve the interests and worldviews of the white, 
settler, imperialist, capitalist state. Legitimizing multiple and often silenced 
ways of knowing and being acknowledges the fluidity and diversity of 
global, interconnected knowledge systems, contexts, histories, politics, 
spiritualties, and onto-epistemologies. Through the power of oral culture, 
the editors and authors in this book open possibilities for dreaming differ-
ent educational futures with beautiful pedagogical invitations that include 
pre and post activities and lesson plans. This book, while essential for pre-
service and practicing educators, is also useful for families, community 
leaders, and people who engage with children and youth that are commit-
ted to centering the power of oral cultures.

In following the editors’ path in Chap. 1, I intentionally refrain from 
citations and references to honor orality. When I consider the power of 
oral culture, I immediately remember stories, idioms, proverbs, and folk-
lore tales I learned from my parents and grandparents, as well as elders, 
community leaders, and spiritual teachers. I remember sitting on the floor 
massaging my grandmother’s feet, while my grandfather would share sto-
ries about life in Zanzibar and growing up in India. These stories, filled 
with lessons and values of non-violence, spirituality, where we come from 
and who we are, gave me a sense of self, home, community, and belong-
ing. I remember my father sharing “words of wisdom” that often centered 
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ideas from South Asian philosophers and eastern spiritualties that I simply 
did not have access to in school or society. I remember my mother sharing 
life lessons through idioms and proverbs that were often a mix of Hindi, 
Trinidadian Creole, and English, and often had an element of searing 
truth and honesty about the complicities, complexities, and failings of the 
human experience. These ideas gave me access to entirely different thought 
systems that helped me make sense of myself in this world and the lan-
guage and concepts to speak back to ideas and injustices I was experienc-
ing and noticing. I think about idioms I learned from community and 
spiritual leaders that often included lessons and learnings from the natural 
world, the more-than-human. These lessons come back to me, again and 
again, each time with a different resonance, a different meaning, and a 
deeper experience of embodied knowing. I also think about the power of 
poetry, chanting, and prayers that are central to so many cultures and tran-
scend generations, geographies, and communities. They have taught me 
about the importance of the relationship between the speaker, the listener, 
and the space in-between that both suspends and expands time and space.

In retrospect, this was necessary learning for me as a young person who 
often felt invisible in school and experienced the psychic split that many 
racialized and marginalized students face in schooling, resulting in the 
“Vidya” at school and the “Vidya” at home. This learning was far removed 
from what I was learning in school, yet so fundamental to my develop-
ment as a young person. I often think about the ways in which students 
and educators are educated away from themselves through mechanisms of 
schooling that have very narrow conceptions of education. I think about 
the ways in which oral cultures share concepts and possibilities that invite 
us into ourselves and our experiences in ways that simply cannot be 
accessed in an English-only classroom that replicates the logics of power 
by privileging one way of knowing and one truth. Oral culture reconnects 
us to our families, our communities, our histories, ourselves. It opens up 
possibilities for radical connection and deep understanding when experi-
ences, values, and ways of knowing and being are shared across cultures. 
These experiences allow us to laugh together, to question together, to 
illuminate together, and to reflect together in ways that a hyper-focus on 
the written word, which is privileged in white supremacy culture, does not 
make possible.

From a spirit of fierce love, I also invite us to consider the limits of oral-
ity and oral culture, as an invitation to ongoing commitments to criticality, 
community, relationality, and justice. I invite us to remember that stories, 
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folklore tales, proverbs, and idioms are not neutral. On the one hand, we 
want to honor the ways in which oral culture makes visible often invisible 
or silenced peoples, cultures, and knowledges. On the other hand, we 
must acknowledge the ways in which cis-hetero-patriarchy, settler colo-
nialism, white supremacy, ableism, imperialism, capitalism, and other 
forms of oppression may be operating in and through how we story our-
selves. I invite us to consider how we might make oral cultures and peda-
gogies more inclusive of, for example, deaf and hard-of-hearing 
communities, or how we might acknowledge silence as a form of orality 
and oral culture. I think about students who may not have access to sto-
ries, idioms, and folklore tales from their communities and cultures for 
various reasons, such as communities that have been forcibly removed 
from ancestral Indigenous ways of knowing and from stories of their lands 
because of various acts of political and psychological warfare. This includes 
survivors of residential schools in Canada, enslaved Africans, people flee-
ing war, and more. How might we expand our understandings and expres-
sions of orality to be more inclusive? Finally, I consider the ways in which 
we are continuously making and remaking culture in every space we are in, 
given that culture is not static. Therefore, while we must acknowledge the 
power of timeless learning through oral culture, we must also make space 
for the co-creation of meaning and knowledge that becomes possible with 
every relation (human, land, waters, the more-than-human) and every 
new configuration of community.

I have such deep gratitude for Dr. Ardavan Eizadirad and Dr. Njoki 
Wane whose commitment and vision in reclaiming the power of oral cul-
ture in education has resulted in this offering. I also have deep gratitude 
for the authors who share of themselves, their families, and communities 
globally, and offer pedagogical possibilities for oral culture. May this book 
invite us to divest from the ways in which we are storied by the white, set-
tler, capitalist, imperialist gaze, and re/turn, re/story, re/claim, and re/
connect on our terms and with our voices, centered on our ever-evolving 
ways of knowing and being.

Faculty of Education, York University� Vidya Shah 
Toronto, ON, Canada
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cultures and it has tremendously contributed to my growth. I vividly 
remember stories my grandparents would tell me as a young child and all 
the proverbs and idioms my parents would use to teach me values and life 
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CHAPTER 1

The Power of Oral Culture in Education: 
Remembering, Documenting, 

and Revitalizing Oral Teachings

Ardavan Eizadirad and Njoki Wane

Objectives

•	 To create awareness about the importance and power of oral culture 
in education

•	 To outline how oral culture and storytelling through proverbs, idi-
oms, and folklore tales can be an effective educational tool

•	 To discuss oral culture as a medium to engage students and to miti-
gate systemic barriers and inequities in education
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Introduction

This chapter discusses the importance of oral culture in education from 
theorizing to its applications in  local communities and via daily interac-
tions with others. By theorizing oral culture, the authors Ardavan Eizadirad 
and Njoki Wane, discuss its significance and impact as a universal language 
across generations and different geographies and spaces, particularly how 
it has helped maintain cultures, traditions, and languages through elders, 
the family unit, and other key figures in the community. With intentional-
ity, the authors do not use any citations or references to honor and centre 
orality as a powerful medium for teaching and learning. Through a back-
and-forth dialogical conversation, Ardavan and Njoki discuss their identi-
ties, professional, and lived experiences with orality and how they have 
grown in different ways from exposure to a variety of proverbs, idioms, 
and folklore tales. The chapter concludes by outlining how oral culture 
can be used in education to engage students through storytelling and on 
a larger scale to address and take actions towards systemic inequities.

The remainder of the chapter is a conversation between the two book 
co-editors, Ardavan Eizadirad and Njoki Wane, about their vision for the 
book and why such collection of works examining oral culture through 
the use of proverbs, idioms, and folklore takes across different countries 
and continents was much needed and overdue to demonstrate the power 
of oral culture in education and beyond. The conversation was recorded 
over a remote meeting and then transcribed and reviewed for accuracy. 
Yes, there may be some grammar errors throughout the conversations 
documented, but we have kept it to maintain the authenticity of the oral 
conversations that took place and show how the power of oral culture is 
more about its impact rather than its semantics associated with “proper” 
form of expressing ideas. The key questions posed to guide the discussions 
have been placed in italics to help the reader navigate the conversations. 
The subheadings throughout the chapter reflect the big ideas in the guid-
ing questions.

Positionality and Lived Experiences of the Authors 
with Oral Culture and Storytelling

Ardavan: So anything you want to share about yourself and tell us what is the 
importance and power of oral culture in your life given your identity and 
lived experiences.

  A. EIZADIRAD AND N. WANE
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Njoki: Whenever I think of oral culture or anything to do with orality, 
I cannot help it, but what comes to mind is my upbringing in rural Kenya. 
My parents did not have straight conversations with us, but everything 
was framed around proverbs, or wise sayings or stories. We would sit 
around the fire when dinner was being made or around a fire outside on 
our homestead. My father used to have a pit fire and we would sit around 
it as he narrated or shared his experiences of the wars that he had partici-
pated in, especially the Second World War. At the end of each story, or 
experience, he would share with us what the lessons he learnt. With time, 
we had mastered his style of teaching, and we knew that at the end of his 
story-telling, he would ask us; What did we learn? His style of story-telling 
was full of examples. For instance, he would say: he did not just say, you 
children just sit there I’m going to tell you ABCD. He will normally say 
I’ll give you an example; then he would proceed in giving that example. 
He always had a talking stick that he would wave around when he was 
sharing his stories with us. That’s how my evenings were spent while 
growing up in rural Kenya. I still remember the various events like it was 
like yesterday. I’ll give you one example. We had been told by our parents 
never to go to the river because  of  crocodiles and currents. But many 
times we disobeyed. When we came home, instead of being spanked, my 
dad will say, OK, you know what you guys have done? And we would nod 
our heads. He would then say: By going to a river that is invested with a 
lot of crocodiles and river currents, you will either be eaten by the croco-
diles or be swept away and you’ll be dead. I still remember those moments 
and the stories outside on our courtyard. I still see my mother in the 
kitchen cooking dinner using firewood and narrating stories. What these 
forms of teaching inculcated in me was the importance of listening. That 
was my life growing up in a village in Kenya.

Ardavan: Great thank you for sharing. For me, you know, I was born 
in Iran and immigrated to Canada when I was in elementary school. But 
very similarly, uh, during social gatherings during educational or teachable 
moments my grandparents and my parents would use proverbs and idioms 
and sometimes folklore tales to really open the conversation, especially 
when it was about tough conversations. Those statements and the type of 
storytelling as the medium was so universal, you were able to understand. 
You wouldn’t take it personal and it was so common given the traditions 
and practices and what’s unique, and I’m sure very similar in Africa, as 
different parts of Iran have their own subcultures from mannerisms to 
traditions to even food and how they speak. These proverbs and idioms, 
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they are universal and accepted by the various subcultures, and you know, 
at a time when you know the literacy rate was low, it was really founda-
tional in maintaining teachings across generations, across spaces, and 
across communities. So for me I always remember them similar to you, 
having these conversations at home, on walks going from one place to 
another when I would walk with my parents and grandparents, and we’d 
have these deep conversations where either at the start, middle, or end it 
involved a proverb or an idiom. I think it has become part of many Iranian 
households who also have migrated all around the world. Oral culture has 
become a way to maintain who they are and connect to their roots. In the 
chapter I wrote, I talk about how you know, given the extensive history of 
the Persian empire, you know the stories were mixed with mythology and 
captured in a book called Shahnameh which helped maintain the Farsi 
language separate from Arabic. So I think oral cultures and traditions, 
because they are so accessible, become universal and it travels across con-
tinents and spaces and even though they have their, you know unique 
adaptations, the message is the same, and people of all ages from all walks 
of life, whether they have formal education or not, whether they’re elders 
or children, they can relate to it, and that’s the power of theorizing it, and 
in a way legitimizing it and centering it.

Njoki: Wow, that’s so like my life. This goes on to show what I shared 
with you; I totally agree with you about the universality of proverbs, idi-
oms and folk tales. This last Christmas my nanas came to my home and 
they all wanted to hear about stories about Africa, growing up in rural 
Kenya and I found myself asking them to sit around me; and to repeat aha 
while I was narrating the stories. They all did that and couldn’t wait for me 
to start my story. Hopefully one day I’ll take them so there is that notion 
that no matter where you are, you can use this system of oral teachings. At 
the end of each story, I asked them what they thought the meaning was. 
It was interesting to listen to their different opinions and interpretation of 
the stories or proverbs. I find that this form of teaching engages children 
and brings their minds to a particular focus, a particular centering of their 
mind, which is very important when it comes to the intellectual stimula-
tion or cultivation of young children’s minds.

Ardavan: Agreed! So I think it’s a good transition to the next question, 
which you’ve already started kind of discussing. Why is it important to 
theorize oral culture and particularly what is its importance in the educa-
tion system, whether historically or when you think of social issues hap-
pening now?
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Significance of Theorizing Oral Culture: Disrupting 
Colonial Logic

Njoki: When I think of theorizing, proverbs, and folklore tales, what 
comes to mind is the colonial logic. The colonial logic and its ideologies 
displaced our oral culture. There was no place for non-Eurocentric form 
of teaching and orality sort of challenged the status quo. Oral culture was 
viewed as a waste of time and had no place in formal education. Thinking 
about all this, I always wonder why I did not embrace orality sooner or 
more publicly. I do use stories while teaching, if for nothing else, to draw 
from something that is familiar to me. It legitimizes my own ways of 
knowing. It legitimizes my Indigenous ways of teaching and knowing. It’s 
a way of disrupting the colonial mindset. We have to be forceful in show-
ing that, there are multiple ways of delivering education. This anthology 
gives us a chance to decenter the only way that has dominated our educa-
tion system—Eurocentric paradigms. We cannot sit on the side and allow 
the erasure of other ways of knowing because of our silence. We would be 
allowing the erasure of teachings that had been passed to us from genera-
tion to generation. Ngu ̃gı ̃ wa Thiong’o talks about it in his book 
Decolonizing the Mind (1986); has voiced over and over about the dis-
connect between the stories my parents would tell us in the evening and 
what we learnt in colonial schools. The colonial education drove to create 
a total colonial separation from our own reality, and we were supposed to 
consume that silently. We must reclaim and recenter our oral ways of 
knowing. That does not mean that we must dislodge the Eurocentric ways 
of knowing, not at all.

Ardavan: I agree with everything you’ve said. I think theorizing oral 
culture centers its importance. We have been very intentional in the 
authors we have gathered for this collection to make sure we have repre-
sentations from different continents and from different identities because 
it speaks to how people were impacted by oral culture universally. It also 
speaks to how authors felt rejuvenated reflecting on their interactions and 
learnings from oral culture and how retelling became a form of revitaliz-
ing. To be able to tell these stories and for it to come together across 
spaces and continents around the collective message of its importance 
reflects education as a community project. You know we commonly hear 
it takes a village to raise a child and within that community everyone has a 
role whether siblings, parents, coaches, or teachers. Centering orality is 
important to dismantle the hierarchy which we often see in traditional 
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schooling and even at post-secondary institutions. The way the system is 
set up, where there is a big power imbalance rooted in inequities of poli-
cies and practices. With the oral culture, you know, everyone is there com-
ing to the table with a growth mindset kind of going back to the stories I 
remember when I was young. I would love to hear scary stories from my 
grandmother and you know it was good but also it was so engaging. I 
would also then have a hard time sleeping, but I loved spending that time 
with her listening to the stories she shared. Thinking about centering oral 
culture in the academia, it’s a way of disrupting the hegemonic citational 
practices that have such a strong hold on what can be published and in 
what ways. For example, when I am writing various chapters for books, if 
I’m using a proverb, the publisher will ask me, well, this needs to be cited 
for its original use. But I try to push back and say, well, nobody owns the 
proverb’s right to citation because nobody knows its original source since 
it has been passed down through generations and generations. So I think 
that’s one example of why it is so important to center these oral knowl-
edges and teachings: not in a way of claiming it as if someone owns it, but 
the importance of sharing it to continue its impact in a way that is valued 
and legitimized in the education system, not as a superficial add on, but 
within the official curriculum because it’s impactful and I think it also con-
nects to maintaining and valuing different identities. For even myself when 
I came here to Canada, even though I still speak my first language of Farsi 
fluently, I struggle more when it comes to writing and reading it due to 
lack of exposure, and so oral culture through conversations at home with 
my parents and family members was a way for me to stay connected to my 
cultural heritage and roots. It was also a way to learn my family history, to 
want to go back home to Iran and visit the country and learn about spaces 
and places and lived experiences of people in the community. So I think 
oral culture is almost a tool as much as a pedagogy to keep people engaged 
and make education a community project.

Njoki: I would like to add to what you have said; I still remember one 
particular song that, my grandmother and my own mother sang to me 
while growing up. I sang to my children and now my own daughter sings 
to her children. The song had teachings about how to deal with an enemy; 
friends and how to be obedient. I was surprised when one of my grand-
children asked me to sing it to her. The songs which I learned before as a 
young child growing up, I still remember and unknowingly, I’ve passed 
them on to my children; who have passed them to their children.
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Ardavan: Those are great examples! I think it speaks to the next question 
that explores how is oral culture passed and shared intergenerationally.

Oral Culture and Storytelling as a Medium 
and Tool 

for Relationship-Building Intergenerationally

Ardavan: For me, I see it influencing us in many ways. As you mentioned, 
even through lullabies. I also see it in music. We see it in many traditions 
where we have folklore dancing and singing. We have folklore ceremony 
which you know many elders and knowledge keepers are involved with. 
For example, every time my dad, who’s away from his home country of 
Iran, when he gets homesick he watches films in Farsi language and listens 
to folklore music. When he sees or hears cultural references to places or 
food or dance relating to his community in Iran, it gives him a boost of 
energy. It’s food for the soul, uh, even with food. I mean food is a big 
component of Iranian culture, and so I think a lot of these conversations 
and sharing of teachings happen over food when people come over or they 
host events. The elders playing a key role with the sharing of teaching 
through oral culture is common across many continents where people go 
to elders for their advice and insights. It’s a form of respect to tap into 
their lived experiences. But you know in the Western hemisphere lived 
experiences is not as valued. Maybe perhaps a little bit more in this, you 
know, quote unquote woke culture, but still you could see the binary and 
superiority affiliated with quantitative versus qualitative research, even in 
educational institutions we work in such as universities. Lastly, I think…

Njoki: Before you go to the next question…
Ardavan: No, go ahead. We’re on the same one.
Njoki: Ohhh ok. Go ahead then finish.
Ardavan: I think lastly oral culture is a tool for relationship building. 

That’s how I see it. It allows relationships to grow. When you think of 
your positive experiences with a meaningful teacher, a caring adult or a 
coach, a lot of times it was the oral conversations that initiated and main-
tained that relationship. So I think the beauty of oral culture is it allows for 
you to make relationships and it’s very similar to when you travel to a new 
country or a new community you listen and learn and you ask questions 
and through that oral sharing, particularly even if you don’t know the 
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language, you’re able to kind of figure it out and put things together to 
contribute to your knowledge and insights gained.

Njoki: The question of maintaining and passing down oral culture 
intergenerationally; is done in such a way that, we do not even know it is 
being done. The example I provided above is a proof of this point. Yes, I 
never thought my children or paid attention when they were growing up 
about the songs I would sing while cooking or doing other work around 
the house. I remember one of my children saying to me how I would tell 
them a proverb when they had done something I was not happy with. You 
can clearly see; how generationally this information is passed on which I 
believe is critical to the maintenance of a culture. What we are doing by 
writing this book is showing that you cannot forget its importance. This is 
something that each family should cultivate in their home. I hope this 
book will be reawakening to not those who have contributed to the book 
but others who will read it or use it in their own classroom! We are awak-
ening a discourse that we should never forget oral culture. Even if you 
don’t have young children find a way of telling stories. The notion of 
remembering and not forgetting relates to learning who you are, as you 
have articulated it so clearly you know as an Iranian. It’s the same thing 
with me as a Kenyan, how I’m a Kenyan from a particular group of people. 
It’s what makes me who I am as a Black woman in this continent in this 
point in time and in the academia.

Ardavan: Beautiful and so powerful! As you said, it’s a form of revital-
izing who we are in a way where people are not ashamed of their culture 
and ways of life including traditions and ceremony, but in a way that 
they’re proud and willing to teach others about it through oral culture and 
sharing. That’s what it means to center it! Oral culture has touched every 
corner of the world due to migration and displacement, sometimes you 
know due to tragic events and systemic oppression, but everybody for 
example has heard the saying don’t judge a book by its cover. We don’t 
know who said that originally, but that’s something someone at some 
point in their life is gonna hear as part of a teachable moment. I think this 
is a good segue to our next question and we’ve kind of talked about it a 
little bit, but we’re gonna discuss it even more by relating it to current 
events. The question is why is oral culture important and how can it be used 
to tackle current social issues and inequities in education?
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Power of Oral Culture in Mitigating Systemic 
Inequities in Education

Njoki: Researching education, the inequities in education can be very 
exhausting. I would like to emphasize, after highlighting the inequities in 
our education, we should move to the next step of sharing about the cul-
tures from around the world. If I’m sharing something from the continent 
of Africa and you’re sharing something from the Iranian culture, and when 
we compare notes there are similarities in that, then why can’t we do the 
same thing with education? Why can’t the mainstream listen to the voices 
from other cultures in the world? What are they masking? We need to ask 
those questions. Because if they’re willing to unmask, then they can actu-
ally benefit from the richness of it especially here in Canada. If we gave 
equal value to the knowledges coming from every corner of our world. 
However, there has to be people who are willing to listen and willing to 
do the work to shift the ways education is delivered in our classrooms. I 
think that’s where the problem is, unwillingness to change. Yes we have all 
the answers to create a just world. The solutions are there, but I think the 
current makeup of education, the current makeup of how education is 
delivered, how education is theorized unless there is a way of going back 
to the drawing board, there will always be inequities within the educa-
tional system.

Ardavan: I agree! I think the root cause of many of the systemic ineq-
uities in education and outside of it is the intersection of power, privilege, 
and profit. I call it the three P’s, and when they intersect it often leads to 
inequitable power relations and inaccessibility to opportunities where 
identities from equity deserving groups are disadvantaged. Because at 
times even though racialized and minoritized identities work twice or ten 
times as hard, they can’t get access to certain opportunities and that’s a 
major problem. Connecting what we are discussing to some of key influ-
ential scholars is important both within and outside of Canada. I think of, 
you know, Kimberly Crenshaw and the concept of intersectionality. I think 
of Gloria Ladson Billings and the importance of socio-culturally relevant 
and responsive pedagogies and teachings. bell hooks and teaching for 
community and rest in peace to her who died recently. And more recently, 
the works of Django Paris around culturally sustaining pedagogies; we 
want to teach social culturally relevant skills like learning the English and 
French language in Canada but if it’s at the expense of forgetting your 
cultural roots and home language, then the process is harmful and 
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detrimental. So we have to look for ways to sustain who we are and help 
others and ourselves heal from the traumas and oppressions we experi-
ence, historically and currently in new forms and modalities. Oral culture 
is the platform and the tool that can facilitate that. It allows listening. It 
allows learning through storytelling and growing as a community. It 
allows to move away from looking or judging others from a colonial deficit 
lens, of grading learners as a A,B,C,D letter grade or product, and instead 
meet them as an educator wherever they are at. It is about meeting learn-
ers where they are at holistically and helping them progress and grow. And 
that means recognizing and reinforcing that success is different for every-
body depending on who they are and where they come from, but the goal 
is to get better and continue to grow. It’s about having a growth mindset 
and I think yourself [Njoki Wane], you know, Carl James, George Dei you 
have been pioneers in the Canadian context for having these important 
discussions and advocating to disrupt the colonial logic. Through your 
work, advocacy, scholarship, and teachings you’ve made students feel val-
ued and seen. We know many students from equity deserving groups 
don’t feel valued, where they constantly experience microaggressions in 
meetings and classrooms. So when they are seen, when they’re able to 
have someone who speaks their language who understands their lived 
experiences, who listens and ask questions instead of making assumptions 
from a deficit lens, it is powerful. That’s when education becomes engag-
ing, empowering, inclusive, and people commit to advocacy and activism 
as part of the teaching and learning process. Connecting these ideas to 
residential schools we see how cultural genocide impedes the transfer of 
culture, language, and traditions from one generation to the next. Fear 
and confusion are created leading to self-hate and internalized oppression 
in the next generation. Some people stop being proud of who they are and 
their roots and instead internalize stereotypical representations of who 
they are due to accepting colonial logic. I know for example, many people 
in Iran who have nose surgeries due to having long noses. Similar to many 
other people in different cultures, they are trying to alter their physical 
look because of the media representations affiliated with stereotypical 
thinking and hegemonic discourses of what is ideal beauty often associated 
with Eurocentric ideals of being white and skinny. Oral culture allows 
people to accept who they are, to question the metanarratives that are told 
about the way they should look and behave, and facilitates people finding 
their own voice and power within their histories, cultures, languages, and 
traditions.
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Njoki: You know Ardavan, remembering is so important. I keep going 
back to my parents teachings: they always emphasized the importance of 
listening with your heart. You know when somebody says, listen with your 
heart, people often make a joke out of it. They say how do I listen with my 
heart. I listen with my ear. But my parents would always say, when you 
listen with your heart, you will always remember everything. You will 
grow up to be a better person. Listening with your heart evokes your emo-
tions, and you pay more attention. Without telling us, what they were 
doing, my parents were planting seeds of being fair and considerate about 
others. I’ll never forget that. Another thing that they emphasized was; see-
ing with closed eyes. They explained that when you can see with your 
closed eyes then you truly feel and see what is happening. They said when 
you can see with your closed eyes, you’ll be able to cross a river. Again, 
teaching the centrality of a connected mind, body, and soul in relation to 
the land. My parents also talked about ceremonies and elements of cere-
monies, not necessarily telling us to take part in a ceremony, but their 
importance in cleansing the body, the earth, and the community. My par-
ents always emphasized a form of cleansing. I was surprised to see sage and 
tobacco used by Indigenous communities and people in North America. I 
grew up with that, again showing the global universality of some of the 
Indigenous ways of knowing or Indigenous tools of cleansing.

Ardavan: When you said to listen with your heart it reminded me of a 
saying that I constantly heard growing up: you have two ears and one 
mouth, so you should listen more than you talk. That always reminded me 
of, you know, the importance of listening. Listening is an art in and of 
itself, a skill that we try to teach our students to master. Before we go to 
our last question to wrap up, I want to emphasize a few things about this 
chapter, how it is written, as well as the vision for the book. With inten-
tionality we are not citing anybody for this chapter to disrupt citational 
practices rooted in colonial logic, and that was important to both of us. 
Also, the reason why we decided to have a standardized lesson plan for the 
various authors to come up with in activity is to be very intentional with 
how we can use these stories to capture and share oral culture. We want 
everyone including parents, elders, youth, and all other community mem-
bers from all walks of life to bring these stories to life in their households 
and communities. I’m sure there are other unique stories that can further 
be mentioned and shared. This body of work and collection of proverbs, 
idioms, and folklore tales is just the tip of the iceberg and the starting 
point. We hope we can add and contribute many many more to further 
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